pl

BELIZE:

SOCIAL SECURITY (BENEFIT) (AMENDMENT) (NO.2)
REGULATIONS,2019

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS
1. Citation.
2. Amendment of regulation 20.
3. Amendment of regulation 26.
4.  Amendment of regulation 27.
5. Repeal of section 30A.

6. Negative Resolution.



-

amended by deleting the words “forty-nine dollars and
thirty-five cents” and substituting the words “forty-seven
dollars”.

No. 30] . Social Security 1
BELIZE:
STATUTORY INSTRUMENT
No. 30 of 2019
REGULATIONS made by the Minister responsible for
Social Security in exercise of the powers conferred
upon him by sections 12, 14, 15, and 64 of the Social
Security Act, Chapter 44 of the Substantive Laws of
Belize, Revised Edition 2011, and all other powers
thereunto him enabling.
(Gazetted 16™ March, 2019)
\ 1. These Regulations may be cited as the Citation,
4
SOCIAL SECURITY (BENEFIT)
(AMENDMENT)REGULATIONS, 2019,
and shall be read and construed as one with the Social  Sub. Leg,
Security (Benefits) Regulations, which, as amended, are ~ [yp I_f,‘i";, 2
hereinafter referred to as the principal Regulations. S.L 99 of 1993
188 of 1994
39 of 1996
70 of 1997
89 of 1998
108 of 1999
131 of 2000
89 of 2011
33 of 2016
7 of 2019
2. Regulation 20 (4)(a)of the principal Regulationsis =~ Amendment

of regulation
20.



¥

2

e/
Social Security [No. 30

Amendment
of regulation
26.

Amendment
of regulation
27.

Repeal of
30A.

Negative
Resolution,

3. Regulation 26 (4)(a) of the principal Regulations is
amended by deleting the words “forty-nine dollars and
thirty-five cents” and substituting the words “forty-seven
dollars”.

4. Regulation 27(2) of the principal Regulations is
amended forty-nine dollars and thirty-five cents” and
substituting the words “forty-seven dollars”.

S. Regulation 30A of the principal Regulations is
repealed.

6. TheseRegulations are subject tonegative resolution.

MADE by the Minister responsible for Social Security
this 7" day of March 2019.

-

(RT. HON. DEAN O. BARRO
Prime Minister
(Minister responsible for Social Security)

Printed in Belize by the Government Printer




