Social Security

BELIZE:

SOCIAL SECURITY (FINANCIAL AND ACCOUNTING)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2021

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS

1. Citation,
2. Amendment of regulation 14.

3. Negative resolution,



No. 82] Social Security

BELIZE:
STATUTORY INSTRUMENT

No. 82 of 2021

REGULATIONS made by the Minister responsible Jor
social security in exercise of the powers conferred
upon him by sections 46 and 64 of the Social Security
Act, Chapter 44 of the Substantive Laws of Belize,
Revised Edition 2011 > and all other powers thereunto
him enabling.

(Gazetted 24* July, 2021)

1. These Regulations may be cited as the

SOCIAL SECURITY (FINANCIAL AND
ACCOUNTING) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS, 2021,

and shall be read and construed as one with the Social
Security (Financial and Accounting) Regulations, which, as
amended, is hereinafter referred to as the principal

Regulations.

2. Regulation 14(1) of the principal Regulations is
amended—

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “22.50%” and
substituting “19.0%";

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “65.00%” and
substituting “72.0%”; and

Citation.

Sub. Leg, 1991

Edn. CAP, 34

p.99

S.L 39 of 2002.
S.L 89 of 2003,
S.I. 14 of 2009,
S.L 6 of 2019,

Amendment
of regulation
14.



2 Social Security [No. 82

(¢) in paragraph (¢) by deleting “12.50%” and
substituting “9.0%"”.

Nes*:“:_e 3. These Regulations are subject to negative resolution.
resoiution.

MADE by the Minister responsible for Social Security
this 28th day of June, 2021.

o)

ON. JOHN BRICENO
Prime Minister
ister responsible for Social Security)

Printed in Belize by the Government Printer



